

LUBE OILS, ANTIFREEZE AND GREASE 2018 2-6-18	MANGO DISTRIBUTING CO	SIEVEKING INC	SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC	BAUMAN OIL DISTRIBUTORS INC
	6918 FRONT ST BARNHART MO 63012	4636 WALDO IND DR HIGH RIDGE MO 63049	2600 N. CENTRAL EXPRESSWAY STE 400 RICHARDSON TX 75080	1503 COMMERCIAL BLVD HERCULANEUM MO 63048
If an emergency, can we call you after regular hours?	YES	YES	YES	YES
If yes, name of party to call:	TOM DENMAN	SCOTT SEMAR	BRADLEY STRIBLING	BOBBY VENZ
Telephone number:	(314) 402-5975	(573) 200-3165	(314) 943-0281	(314) 550-5770
MOTOR OILS				
15 W 40			*****	
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Coventional/ synthetic blend	CONV	CONV	COVENTIONAL CK 4	SYN BLEND
Size of drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL	55 GAL DRUM	55 GAL
Price of drum	\$371.45	\$370.15	\$435.00	\$367.95
Bulk (our tank)	\$6.39/ GAL	\$6.03	\$6.20	\$6.29
10 W 30			****	
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Coventional/ synthetic blend	SB	SYN-B	COVENTIONAL CK 4	SYN BLEND
Size of drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL	55 GAL DRUM	55 GAL
Price of drum	\$296.65	\$387.75	\$435.00	\$395.45
Bulk (our tank)	\$5.03/GAL	\$6.35	\$6.20	\$6.99
5 W 20				
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Coventional/ synthetic blend	SB	SYN-B	SYNTHETIC BLEND	SYN BLEND
Size of drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL	55 GAL DRUM	55 GAL
Price of drum	\$292.25	\$321.75	\$364.98	\$354.75
Bulk (our tank)	\$4.95/GAL	\$5.15	\$5.10	\$5.85
5 W 30			****	DEXOS
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Coventional/ synthetic blend	SB	SYN-B	DEXOS1 GEN2	FULL SYN
Size of drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL	55 GAL DRUM	55 GAL
Price of drum	\$292.25	\$321.75	\$519.00	\$604.45
Bulk (our tank)	\$4.95/GAL	\$5.15	\$8.77	\$10.65

LUBE OILS, ANTIFREEZE AND GREASE 2018 2-6-18	MANGO DISTRIBUTING CO	SIEVEKING INC	SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC	BAUMAN OIL DISTRIBUTORS INC
	6918 FRONT ST BARNHART MO 63012	4636 WALDO IND DR HIGH RIDGE MO 63049	2600 N. CENTRAL EXPRESSWAY STE 400 RICHARDSON TX 75080	1503 COMMERCIAL BLVD HERCULANEUM MO 63048
00 W 20			****	
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Coventional/ synthetic blend	FULL SYNTH	FULL SYN	DEXOS1 GEN2	FULL SYN
Size of drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL	55 GAL DRUM	55 GAL
Price of drum	\$407.75	\$553.85	\$553.83	\$565.95
Bulk (our tank)	\$7.05/GAL	\$9.37	\$9.00	\$9.99
HYDRAULIC/TRANSMISSION OIL				
424 Type/Unitrac Hydraulic Oil				
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Size of Drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL	55 GAL DRUM	55 GAL
Price Per Drum	\$321.40	\$422.40	\$340.40	\$402.05
Bulk (Our Tank)	\$5.48/GAL	\$6.98	\$4.84	\$6.56
10 Weight Hydraulic Oil				
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS AW 46	PHILLIPS 66
Size of Drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL	55 GAL DRUM	55 GAL
Price Per Drum	\$286.75	\$456.50	\$340.40	\$553.30
Bulk (Our Tank)	\$4.85/GAL	\$7.60	\$4.84	\$9.59
ATF Dextron 6 Transmission Oil				
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Size of Drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL	55 GAL DRUM	55 GAL
Price Per Drum	\$493.00	\$625.90	\$568.00	\$724.90
Bulk (Our Tank)	\$8.60/GAL	\$10.68	\$8.93	\$12.68
ANTIFREEZE				
ANTIFREEZE (GREEN)				
Brand	J.D. STREET	CHEVRON	NO BID	ROAD CHOICE
Size of Drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL		55 GAL
Price Per Drum	\$343.75	CONCENT - \$425.81 50/50 - \$286.55		\$310.20
Bulk (Our Tank)	\$6.25/GAL	CONCENT - \$7.75 50/50 - \$5.21		

LUBE OILS, ANTIFREEZE AND GREASE 2018 2-6-18	MANGO DISTRIBUTING CO	SIEVEKING INC	SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC	BAUMAN OIL DISTRIBUTORS INC
	6918 FRONT ST BARNHART MO 63012	4636 WALDO IND DR HIGH RIDGE MO 63049	2600 N. CENTRAL EXPRESSWAY STE 400 RICHARDSON TX 75080	1503 COMMERCIAL BLVD HERCULANEUM MO 63048
ANTIFREEZE EXTENDED LIFE (RED)			NO BID	
Brand	ZEREX	CHEVRON		ROAD CHOICE
Size of Drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL		55 GAL
Price Per Drum	\$437.25	CONCENT - \$571.94 50/50 - \$338.96		\$326.15
Bulk (Our Tank)	\$7.95/GAL	CONCENT - \$10.40 50/50 - \$6.15		
ANTIFREEZE EXTENDED LIFE DEXCOOL (ORANGE)			NO BID	
Brand	ZEREX	CHEVRON		CHAMPION
Size of Drum	55 GALLON	55 GAL		55 GAL
Price Per Drum	\$547.25	CONCENT - \$616.60 50/50 - \$437.30		\$549.45
Bulk (Our Tank)	\$9.95/GAL	CONCENT - \$11.20 50/50 - \$7.95		
ANTIFREEZE EXTENDED LIFE (GOLD)			NO BID	
Brand	SUPERS	CHEVRON		SERV-PRO
Size of Drum	55GALLON	55 GAL		55 GAL
Price Per Drum	\$447.70	CONCENT - \$438.62 50/50 - \$323.34		\$486.20
Bulk (Our Tank)	\$8.14	CONCENT - \$7.97 50/50 - \$5.88		
GREESE/GEAR OIL				
80 W 90 GEAR OIL				
Brand	VP LUBES	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Size of Drum	55 GALLON	16 GAL (120#)	55 GAL DRUM	410 LB
Price Per Drum	\$618.20	\$135.00	\$520.00	\$631.40
Bulk (Our Tank)	\$11.24/GAL	\$8.45 PER GAL	\$11.99	
75 W/40 SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL				
Brand	SUPERS	CHEVRON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	PHILLIPS 66
Size of Drum	5 GALLON	16 GAL (120#)	5 GAL PAIL 120 LB KEG	390 LB
Price Per Drum	\$173.90	\$392.80	\$100.46/PAIL \$314.82/KEG	\$2,102.10
Bulk (Our Tank)	-	\$24.55 PER GAL	NO BID	
Multipurpose Grease in Tubes	VALVOLINE CRIMSON MP GREASE			
# Tubes in Case	50	10 TUBES	10	\$40.00
Price Per Case	\$134.50	\$23.34	\$21.29	\$84.00

LUBE OILS, ANTIFREEZE AND GREASE 2018 2-6-18	MANGO DISTRIBUTING CO	SIEVEKING INC	SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC	BAUMAN OIL DISTRIBUTORS INC
	6918 FRONT ST BARNHART MO 63012	4636 WALDO IND DR HIGH RIDGE MO 63049	2600 N. CENTRAL EXPRESSWAY STE 400 RICHARDSON TX 75080	1503 COMMERCIAL BLVD HERCULANEUM MO 63048
Delivery to Hillsboro, DeSoto, or House Springs Maintenance sheds included?	YES	YES	YES	YES
% discount off of list price on any additional lubricants, oils and fluids needed.	10%	N/A	5%	5%
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS				
NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED	Y	Y	Y	Y
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION (Y/N):	Y	N	Y	Y
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED	Y	N	Y	Y
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED LETTER STATING NO REAL OR PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN JEFFERSON COUNTY	Y	Y	Y	Y
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N)	Y	Y	Y	Y
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO:	Y	Y	Y	Y
COMPANY INFORMATION AND SIGNATURE	Y	Y	Y	Y
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
COMMENTS:	SEE ATTACHED		**FOR BULK DELIEVERIES, SAFETY-KLEEN WILL PUMP OUT OF A TOTE INTO YOUR BULK STORAGE TANKS. 5W20, AND HYDRUALICS WILL BE DELIVERED BY BULK TANK TRUCK. SEE SPECS SHEETS	