

BID TABULATION - CHANNEL POST 2018

CHANNEL POST 2018 2-6-2018	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATION	HALL SIGNS INCORPORATED	LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO LLC	J&A TRAFFIC PRODUCTS	VULCAN SIGNS	OSBURN ASSOCIATES INC	TRAFFIC & PARKING CONTROL INC	
	PO BOX 54091 JACKSON MS 39288	4495 W VERNAL PIKE BLOOMINGTON IN 47404	PO BOX 329 FRANKFORD OH 45628	605 W 40 HWY BLUE SPRINGS MO 64014	PO BOX 1850 FOLEY AL 36536	PO BOX 912 LOGAN OH 43138	5100 W BROWN DEER RD BROWN DEER WI 53223	
500 - 5 FT. CHANNEL POST: (PRICE PER POST)			\$6.20	\$7.10	\$5.54	\$7.05	\$10.59	
1000** - 5FT CHANNEL POST: (PRICE PER POST)			\$6.11	\$6.55	\$5.27	\$7.05	\$8.59	
1000 - 7 1/2 FT. CHANNEL POST: (PRICE PER POST)			\$9.30	\$10.65	\$8.08	\$11.28	\$12.18	
2000** - 7 1/2 FT. CHANNEL POSTS: (PRICE PER POST)			\$9.17	\$9.38	\$7.68	\$11.28	\$11.03	
DATE PRICE EXPIRES:			12/31/2018	1/31/2018	ONE YEAR	2/2/2019	2/6/2019	
COMMENTS:	NO BID	NO BID						
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS								
NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED			Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION (Y/N):			N	N	Y	N	N	
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED			Y	N	Y	N	N	
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED LETTER STATING NO REAL OR PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN JEFFERSON COUNTY			Y	N	N	N	N	
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N)			Y	Y	N	Y	Y	
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO:			Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	
COMPANY INFORMATION AND SIGNATURE			Y	Y	Y	Y	N	
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED			N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
COMMENTS:	NO BID	NO BID					MISSING PAGE 12	